
Town of
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

NUMBER NRWD-2017-001
235 NORTH STREET
NORTH READING, MA  01864

BID TABULATION

THE NORTH READING WATER DEPARTMENT IS REQUESTING
QUOTATIONS ON THE FOLLOWING WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM
MATERIALS.  ALL MATERIALS SHALL CONFORM TO THE LATEST
REVISION OF THE APPLICABLE AWWA STANDARDS FOR THE ITEMS.
ALL PRICES QUOTED SHALL INCLUDE DELIVERY TO THE
NORTH READING DPW FACILITY AT 166 CHESTNUT STREET IN
NORTH READING, MA.
QUANTITIES ARE FOR QUOTATION ONLY - NO QUANTITIES
ARE GUARANTEED TO BE ORDERED.

BASIS OF AWARD:  AWARD WILL BE MADE ON A LINE ITEM BASIS

90 FT 6" DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN - CLASS 52 - AWWA C-151 14.50 /FT $1,305.00 13.40 /FT $1,206.00 14.98 /FT $1,348.20 13.44 /FT $1,209.60 15.13 /FT $1,361.70 /FT No Bid

90 FT 8" DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN - CLASS 52 - AWWA C-151 20.50 /FT $1,845.00 18.95 /FT $1,705.50 21.18 /FT $1,906.20 19.01 /FT $1,710.90 21.39 /FT $1,925.10 /FT No Bid

36 FT 10" DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN - CLASS 52 - AWWA C-151 26.50 /FT $954.00 24.78 /FT $892.08 27.69 /FT $996.84 24.84 /FT $894.24 27.97 /FT $1,006.92 /FT No Bid

2 EA 8" X 6" MJ HYDRANT TEE - AWWA C-153 136.00 EA $272.00 98.67 EA $197.34 151.67 EA $303.34 103.79 EA $207.58 134.33 EA $268.66 EA No Bid

2 EA 10" X 6" MJ HYDRANT TEE - AWWA C-153 172.00 EA $344.00 125.19 EA $250.38 172.54 EA $345.08 131.69 EA $263.38 145.61 EA $291.22 EA No Bid

2 EA 8" X 8" MJ TEE - AWWA C-153 142.00 EA $284.00 102.57 EA $205.14 138.84 EA $277.68 107.90 EA $215.80 140.21 EA $280.42 EA No Bid

2 EA 10" X 8" MJ TEE - AWWA C-153 178.00 EA $356.00 128.31 EA $256.62 164.50 EA $329.00 134.97 EA $269.94 175.26 EA $350.52 EA No Bid

2 EA 8" X 12" MJ SOLID SLEEVE - AWWA C-153 96.00 EA $192.00 69.81 EA $139.62 96.22 EA $192.44 73.44 EA $146.88 95.04 EA $190.08 EA No Bid

2 EA 10" X 12" MJ SOLID SLEEVE - AWWA C-153 116.00 EA $232.00 83.07 EA $166.14 114.49 EA $228.98 84.38 EA $168.76 113.09 EA $226.18 EA No Bid

4 EA 6" MJ DUCTILE IRON GATE VALVES (OPEN RIGHT) - AWWA C-515 515.00 EA $2,060.00 448.00 EA $1,792.00 464.57 EA $1,858.28 503.43 EA $2,013.72 507.93 EA $2,031.72 500.00 EA $2,000.00

4 EA 8" MJ DUCTILE IRON GATE VALVES (OPEN RIGHT) - AWWA C-515 815.00 EA $3,260.00 713.00 EA $2,852.00 783.44 EA $3,133.76 801.95 EA $3,207.80 809.01 EA $3,236.04 812.38 EA $3,249.52

2 EA 10" MJ DUCTILE IRON GATE VALVES (OPEN RIGHT) - AWWA C-515 1,280.00 EA $2,560.00 1,112.00 EA $2,224.00 1,221.53 EA $2,443.06 1,250.41 EA $2,500.82 1,261.49 EA $2,522.98 1,317.29 EA $2,634.58

12 EA 6" MJ ACCESSORY PACKS 20.00 EA $240.00 14.50 EA $174.00 33.07 EA $396.84 23.10 EA $277.20 13.86 EA $166.32 32.00 EA $384.00

12 EA 8" MJ ACCESSORY PACKS 24.00 EA $288.00 16.50 EA $198.00 44.99 EA $539.88 27.08 EA $324.96 15.59 EA $187.08 36.00 EA $432.00

6 EA 10" MJ ACCESSORY PACKS 32.00 EA $192.00 23.50 EA $141.00 65.06 EA $390.36 37.44 EA $224.64 22.08 EA $132.48 51.00 EA $306.00

8 EA 5'-0" VALVE BOXES COMPLETE WITH COVER (WATER) 72.00 EA $576.00 66.50 EA $532.00 57.34 EA $458.72 58.71 EA $469.68 51.55 EA $412.40 EA No Bid

Waterline Supply

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

HD Waterworks Supply

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

F.W. Webb

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Ferguson Waterworks

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Billerica Winwater

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICEQUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

North Reading, MA

Everett J Prescott


