Bid Tab - Copper Tubing

North Reading Water Department

Quotation Number: NRWD-2016-002

14-Jul-15 Billerica Everett J
Avon Supply Co Winwater Works Prescaott, Inc Stiles Company Ti-Sales Water Line Supply | Water Works Supply
Woburn, MA Billerica, MA Middleton, MA Norwood, Ma Sudbury, Ma North Andover, MA Malden, MA
Roll Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Quantity Iltem Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
6 60-foot rolls of 3/4" Type K Copper Tubing $207.23 $1,243.38 | $186.00 |$1,116.00| $195.00 |$1,170.00( $167.40 |$1,004.40 No Bid No Bid $180.00 |$1,080.00
6 60-foot rolls of 1" Type K Copper Tubing $269.76 $1,618.56 | $242.40 |$1,454.40| $240.00 |$1,440.00( $219.00 |$1,314.00 No Bid No Bid | $242.40 |$1,454.40
Total $2,861.94 $2,570.40 $2,610.00 $2,318.40 $0.00 $0.00 $2,534.40




