
Bid Tab - Service Brass
North Reading Water Department Quotation Number: NRWD-2016-001

14-Jul-15

Ford Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Quantity Item Catalog No. Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

12  3/4" Couplings - CTS Pack Joint x MIP C84-33-NL $17.95 $215.40 $17.00 $204.00 $16.87 $202.44 $15.07 $180.84 No Bid No Bid

12  3/4" Curb Stops - CTS Pack Joint x CTS Pack Joint Z44-333SW-NL $65.13 $781.56 $75.00 $900.00 $70.03 $840.36 $62.56 $750.72 No Bid No Bid

6  3/4" Curb Stops - CTS Pack Joint x FIP Z41-333SW-NL $57.18 $343.08 $68.50 $411.00 $59.36 $356.16 $52.49 $314.94 No Bid No Bid

12  3/4" Iron Pipe Pack Joint x MIP Couplings C85-33-NL $17.80 $213.60 $17.00 $204.00 $20.36 $244.32 $18.18 $218.16 No Bid No Bid

6  3/4" MIP x 1" Iron Pipe Pack Joint Couplings C85-34-NL $26.18 $157.08 $25.00 $150.00 $29.94 $179.64 $26.75 $160.50 No Bid No Bid

6  1" Iron Pipe Pack Joint x MIP Couplings C85-44-NL $27.16 $162.96 $26.00 $156.00 $31.07 $186.42 $27.76 $166.56 No Bid No Bid

$2,009.34 $1,791.72Total $1,873.68

Water Works Supply
Malden, MA

$2,025.00

Ti-Sales
Sudbury, Ma

Water Line Supply
North Andover, MA

Everett J
Prescott, Inc

Middleton, MA
Stiles Company
Norwood, Ma

Billerica
Winwater Works

Billerica, MA


